
ARTISTRY BY TARA
B E S P O K E  B R I D A L  M A K E U P  P A C K A G E S

Ruby Packages

In order to provide my
brides with an affordable
yet high-glam wedding

package, I customised this
package to fit your budget.



This package is the

culmination of 8 years of
experience and expertise,
so you can be sure your
make up will stay put.



In addition to being simple
yet exceptionally results-
driven, the Ruby package

will make you feel
absolutely beautiful on your

Wedding Day!



Emerald Packages

For brides who have always
imagined this day to be

nothing short of perfect, I
have customised the

Emerald package.



This package includes
everything you need to
make your morning flow

comfortably and give you
the makeover of your

dreams.



This perfectly arranged
package covers every detail,
and I work closely with you
during the planning process

to ensure that you are a
happy bride from beginning

to end.



Diamond Package

I am pleased to introduce
my newest addition, the
diamond packages. It is

the crème de la crème of
bridal make-up artistry. 



Putting everything

together in this package
will ensure that working

with me is a lifelong
experience for you.

As a bridal expert, I aim to
provide you with a timeless

soft glam look.



From beginning to end, I
will create a customised

schedule to make sure the
whole day is taken care of

for you and your bridal
party.
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